
A 659

High Street

Tadcaster

start and finish

Deepdale Lane

Deepdale 
Community Centre

Clifford

Thorp Arch

steps

footpath

Thorp Arch Hall

Wharfe 
   Bridge

St Mary’s Church

Walk 1
Short Riverside Walk               2 miles Walk 1       Short Riverside Walk    

River Wharf

A1M

BOSTON SPA

Leaving the High Street turn down Deepdale Lane 
(next to Deepdale Community Centre) follow the road and you 
come to a public bridleway leading down to the riverside, take 
this path as it leads you along the side of a beck and through 
woodland.  Admire the wonderful view of Jackdaw Crag, where 
the path reaches the river and then  turn over the footbridge 
and climb up the steep slope as the footpath takes you along 
the top of the escarpment.  From here you have beautiful views 
across the river to Thorp Arch Hall and surrounding farmland.
The footpath continues at this high level then gently slopes 
down until you reach the meadow to the west of the river 
bridge.  You can then continue along the riverside in an easterly 
direction (Walk 2) or turn back this time taking the lower level 
footpath that runs along the riverbank.  From this lower level 
path you can see the weir and the old mill buildings at Thorp 
Arch.  The lower level path stays close to the river before a steep 
climb brings you back to join the upper path where you can 
then retrace your steps over the footbridge and back up Deep-
dale Lane.  There is an alternative path to the left as the path 
starts to drop down to the footbridge.  If you follow this it will 
also take you back to Deepdale Lane.
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